

CORPORATION OF THE DISTRICT OF BURNABY

AMMENDED TABULATION OF TENDERS FOR

STORM DRAINAGE - BAINBRIDGE STREET

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
September 11, 1970

<u>TENDER NO.</u>	<u>NAME OF COMPANY</u>	<u>BAINBRIDGE</u>
1.	Coyne Construction Co. Ltd.	No bid
2.	H. J. Rai Ltd.	No bid
3.	Globe Excavating Ltd.	\$53,442.50
4.	Construction Cartage Ltd.	45,996.80
5.	Arthon Construction Ltd.	No bid
6.	Lang Log Ltd.	47,122.38

Item 4  
MANAGER'S REPORT NO. 53, 1970

(REVISED TABULATION)

CORPORATION OF THE DISTRICT OF BURNABY  
TABULATION OF TENDERS FOR  
STORM DRAINAGE - HALIFAX, CAMERON, BAINBRIDGE

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
September 11, 1970

TENDER NO.	NAME OF COMPANY	HALIFAX	CAMERON	BAINBRIDGE
1.	Coyne Construction Co. Ltd.	\$64,965.66	\$52,908.58	No bid
2.	H. J. Rai Ltd.	44,407.00	38,583.00	No bid
3.	Globe Excavating Ltd.	46,808.00	38,622.50	\$55,992.50
4.	Construction Cartage Ltd.	49,555.70	40,061.10	48,852.80
5.	Arthon Construction Ltd.	52,583.15	No bid	No bid
6.	Lang Log Ltd.	53,446.45	43,604.91	48,834.28

Item No. 4  
Manager's Report No. 53